
GRATIOT INTEGRATED HEALTH NETWORK

6 0 8  W r i g h t  A v e n u e  
A l m a ,  M I  4 8 8 0 1

OUR MISSION: 
EMPOWERING THE 

LIVES IN OUR 
COMMUNITY BY 

PROVIDING 
EDUCATION AND 

SERVICES. 
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CUSTOMER SERVICE
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CUSTOMER SERVICE  
AT GRATIOT INTEGRATED 

HEALTH NETWORK

WEBSITE
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Interpretation/Translation service 
are available upon request for no 

charge to individuals receiving 
services or requesting services 

here at Gratiot Integrated Health 
Network. 

 
Servicios de interpretación / 

traducción están disponibles bajo 
petición sin cargo a las personas 
que reciben servicios en Gratiot 

Integrated Health Network. 

TRANSLATION



SUGGESTION BOX
 Gratiot Integrated Health Network 
has a suggestion box located next 

to the main entrance where you 
are able to submit suggestions 

anonymously. We value your input 
and appreciate when individuals 

share ideas on how we can 
improve services or make our 

facil it ies more welcoming. 

Our Vision: 
To provide care 

through 
integration, 

collaboration, 
innovative 

services and 
community 
outreach. 

ABOUT US
A brochure is an informative

paper document (often also used
for advertising),  that can be

folded into a template, pamphlet
or leaflet.  Brochures are

promotional documents, primarily
used to introduce a company,

organization,products or services
and inform prospective 

customers or members of the
public of the benefits.

SERVICES
  is the provision of service to 
customers before, during and 

after a purchase. The perception 
of success of such interactions is 

dependent on employees "who can 
adjust themselves to the 
personality of the guest".

HOW WE CAN HELP
•Provide assistance when
obtaining services and information
about what type of services are
available to you.  
 
•Orientation to Gratiot Integrated
Health Network services.   
 
•Provide information about
Recipient Rights.   
 
•Connect you with community and
other mental health resources. 
 
•Provide information from our
resource l ibrary.   
 
•Offer assistance in facil itating
problem resolution related to your
services.   
 
•Provide information on
community involvement activities
and wellness opportunities.    

SERVICES
Gratiot Integrated Health Network 

has a Customer Service 
Representative available to help 

answer questions, provide 
information, and assist with other 
inquires. To contact our Customer 

Service Representative you may 
call  (989)466-4192 or send an 

email to cs@gihn-mi.org.


